
Tuesday, November 2, 2021 
Announcements 

Faculty Section 

Group A has duty this week 

Please Release The Following 

Girls Varsity Tennis 

@ 1:00 

Hey Dons:  Do you need tutoring?  Since many tutoring 
centers aren’t open, For Dons By Dons will be offering 
tutoring every Monday in Room 510 for Math and Science 
and every Wednesday in Room 504 for English, Social 
Studies and Foreign Languages from 3:30-4:30.  Please 
follow our Instagram @for.dons.by.dons for more 
information! 

S V  D O N S  

Athletics 

Girls Varsity Tennis Wild Card Play Off Round 
  @ Sierra Vista - 1:45 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Sports 

Hey Dons!  Are you interested in playing games competitively 
or just playing casually?  Then the SVHS ESports Club is the 
club for you!  Come by Room 608 during lunch for our first 
meeting TODAY!  This meeting is for members and any 
student who wants to join.  Hope to see you all there!! 
 
The Me to We Club will be having a meeting TODAY at 
lunch in Room 505.  See you there! 
 
NAMI will be having their club pictures taken tomorrow 
during lunch.  Please meet near Room 513 and be sure to 
wear green!  Hope to see you there! 
 
CSF will be hosting its second College and Career Q&A on 
Thursday, November 4th, during lunch.  As a reminder, the 
UC application is due at the end of this month, on November 
30th.  If you would like to get an insider scoop on how to 
stand out in your application and write impactful PIQs from 
a UC application reader and the Best Teacher of the Year 
herself, Ms. Payan, join us in Room 506.  The workshop is 
open to all grade levels, regardless of whether or not you are 
a current CSF member. 

Clubs & Activities 
Baseball Intramurals start Monday, November 8th, at 
3:40pm on the Freshman Baseball Field.  Bring your 
glove, hat and a winning attitude.  If you have questions, 
please see Coach Jensen in the Boys PE Office.  See you 
there! 


